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Register Now for the 2025 Annual Meeting 

 

The 2025 ASN Annual Meeting takes place on January 17-19, 2025 at the Westin Irving 
Convention Center at Las Colinas in Dallas, Texas. The 2025 Annual Meeting marks 
the 48th year of ASN driving the evolution of neuroimaging techniques & diagnosis to 

https://www.asnweb.org/i4a/pages/index.cfm?pageid=4183
https://www.marriott.com/event-reservations/reservation-link.mi?id=1705701549113&key=GRP&app=resvlink
https://www.marriott.com/event-reservations/reservation-link.mi?id=1705701549113&key=GRP&app=resvlink
https://www.asnweb.org/i4a/pages/index.cfm?pageid=4183


improve the lives of those with neurologic disorders and you are a vital part of this 
success. 

Register by November 18 to take advantage of the Early Bird Savings! Hotel 
reservations must be made by December 26 to lock in the $179 per night conference 
rate. 

The Annual Meeting Schedule is being enhanced for 2025 by the addition the Wake 
Forest Neurosonology 50th Anniversary Reception for all past attendees and faculty of 
Wake Forest Neurovascular Ultrasound courses and a Silent Auction to benefit ASN 
Awards Program. 

ASN is most grateful to following sponsors for making the 2025 ASN Annual Meeting 
possible: Eli Lilly & Company, Image Monitoring, and NeuraSignal. Additional sponsors 
and exhibitors will be announced soon! 

  
 

https://www.asnweb.org/i4a/ams/meetings/index.cfm?controller=meetings&action=startRegistration&conferenceID=243&reginit=1&pageID=4193
https://www.marriott.com/event-reservations/reservation-link.mi?id=1705701549113&key=GRP&app=resvlink
https://www.marriott.com/event-reservations/reservation-link.mi?id=1705701549113&key=GRP&app=resvlink
https://www.asnweb.org/files/2025%20Annual%20Meeting/ASN_Preliminary_Schedule_102424(1).pdf
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Don't Forget to Renew Your ASN Membership! 

With the new year quickly approaching, don't forget to renew your ASN 
membership. Click here to renew or join. 
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AMA Adopts Policies to Address Challenges in Medical Education 

 

The American Medical Association (AMA) House of Delegates convened its Interim 
Meeting on November 12 and adopted a series of policies to address challenges in 
medical education and the physician workforce.  

Delegates adopted policy aimed at giving greater urgency to addressing the worsening 
primary care physician shortage in rural areas by supporting a comprehensive review of 
the Health Professional Shortage Area (HPSA) scoring system used by the National 
Health Service Corps (NHSC) Loan Repayment Program.  

Delegates adopted policy aimed at reducing the financial and administrative burdens 
associated with reporting CME requirements for physicians by simplifying CME 
reporting by promoting a common reporting standard across medical specialty and 
state medical boards.  

Read more here. 

  
 

 

 

https://www.ama-assn.org/press-center/press-releases/ama-adopts-policies-address-challenges-medical-education?utm_source=twitter&utm_medium=social_ama&utm_term=15229926713&utm_campaign=Interim
https://www.ama-assn.org/press-center/press-releases/ama-adopts-policies-address-challenges-medical-education?utm_source=twitter&utm_medium=social_ama&utm_term=15229926713&utm_campaign=Interim


The Results Are In... 

ASN congratulates the people that successfully passed the NVS and RPNI exams in 
October. The next opportunity to take the NVS or RPNI examination will be February 
2025.  Click here to learn more or email andrea@asnweb.org with questions. 
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